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As night fell on August 16, 1777, American militia led 
by General John Stark had won a resounding victory near 
Bennington, Vermont. In two separate engagements 
against a combined force of Braunschweigers, British 
marksmen, Canadians, Loyalists, and Native Americans, 
they had inflicted nearly one thousand casualties. Among 
these were approximately 750 prisoners. As the American 
troops escorted them to Bennington, the question quickly 
arose: what to do with so many captured enemy soldiers? 
Ultimately, they were placed in different parts of the 
village, but the largest contingent of over 400 Germans 
and Canadians were held in the Bennington 
Meetinghouse. Not designed to hold a large number of 
people for any length of time, the building became the 
scene of an alleged break out the evening of August 17 
that left several Braunschweigers dead and others 
wounded. Although often forgotten, a number of 
American soldiers along with a German prisoner of war 
recorded this incident at the meetinghouse. The event 
tells us something about war and the colonists’ fear of the 
German auxiliary troops. 

Located in southwestern Vermont, Bennington was a 
thriving village in the summer of 1777. A key stop on the 
route of New England troops marching towards Fort 
Edward and the upper Hudson, Bennington contained a 
warehouse and a number of barns filled with stores for 
the Continental Army. The Americans had also 
accumulated herds of cattle and horses near the town to 
support the army’s effort. Indeed, these provisions are 
what prompted British General John Burgoyne to dis-
patch the troops that Stark handily defeated. The village 
had a population of just under 600, but it had swelled in 
the days and months immediately before and after the 
battle.1 Many civilians fled to and through the town as 
Burgoyne’s army advanced ever-farther south toward 
Albany. Furthermore, Stark’s New Hampshire brigade, 
which numbered around eleven hundred, began arriving 
on August 8. Hundreds of Massachusetts, Vermont, and 
New York militia soon followed, and they continued to 
arrive even after the engagement.2 As the battle raged, a 
steady stream of wounded Americans made their way 
back to the town. The prisoners, some of whom were 
also wounded, added to this population, which now 
stood over 3,000. 

Faced with this situation, prisoners were separated 
into various groups and scattered around the town. Who 
actually made these decisions is not recorded. Perhaps 
Stark and local militia officers discussed these arrange-
ments before they departed for battle, although they did 
not know how many prisoners they would need to house, 
if any. The Vermont Council of Safety, which sat at 
Bennington, might have also made the decisions. Regard-
less, the Americans placed the captured officers in a room 
on the upper floor of the famed Catamount Tavern. Ste-
phen Fay ran this two-story wooden structure that had  

served as Ethan Allen and the Green Mountain Boys’s 
headquarters during their disputes with New York over 
land claims before the war. Among the prisoners held in 
the tavern was Julius Wasmus, a Braunschweiger com-
pany surgeon, who recorded the only German account of 
the meetinghouse incident.3 The village also established a 
temporary hospital to treat the several hundred wounded 
soldiers from both sides. Probably located somewhere 
south of the Catamount Tavern, it was soon replaced by a 
more permanent structure across from Ethan Allen’s 
house.4

 

The biggest problem, however, was what to do with 
the hundreds of unwounded rank and file prisoners who 
outnumbered Bennington’s permanent residents. 
Ultimately, these men were held in the meetinghouse, 
Bennington’s largest building. Built between 1763 and 
1764, the two-story structure measured fifty by forty feet, 
and was located about five hundred feet south of the 
Catamount Tavern. Designed as a Congregationalist 
house of worship, the plain unpainted building was the 
logical place to house the prisoners until other arrange-
ments could be made.5

 

How many prisoners jammed the meetinghouse is 
uncertain. General Benjamin Lincoln, the Continental 
officer organizing militia in the region, wrote that Stark 
had captured 37 British soldiers, 398 Germans, 38 
Canadians, and 155 Loyalists, not including officers and 
wounded.6 Presumably not all these prisoners were 
confined in the meetinghouse, but many of the Germans 
and Canadians were, and probably the others too, at least 
temporarily. Wasmus claimed that 480 prisoners packed 
the church. Whatever the exact number, it exceeded the 
building’s capacity. To accommodate them all, the Ameri-
cans placed some prisoners in the second floor galleries,  
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and laid boards over pews or the pulpit, to provide addi-
tional space for the Canadians.7

 

Both the captives and the captors experienced a wide 
range of emotions at the meetinghouse. The prisoners had 
to come to grips with the emotional and psychological 
shock of defeat and capture. What had started as an 
elaborate foraging expedition had gone disastrously 
wrong. Many of them undoubtedly knew that their com-
mander, Lieutenant Colonel Friedrich Baum, had suffered 
a grievous stomach wound that would take his life the 
following day. The same could be said for countless num-
bers of their brothers in arms whom they had seen killed 
or wounded. The Loyalists also had to wonder how their 
neighbors and countrymen would treat people whom they 
considered traitors. Not unexpectedly, the early indi-
cations suggested harsh retribution. As the battle ended, 
the Americans tied the Loyalists together by their necks, 
“like cattle,” bound their hands, and sent them back to 
Bennington led by a Black man.8 The German, Canadian, 
and even the British prisoners found themselves sur-
rounded by a strange and hostile population. Surgeon 
Wasmus recalled, “[t]he inhabitants of this province were 
said to be the worst Rebels; they made disagreeable faces 
and perhaps did not wish to express themselves in overly 
refined terms toward us; but to our comfort, we could not 
understand any of them.”9 It was good that the prisoners 
found consolation in not being able to understand their 
captives, because little comfort existed inside the tightly 
packed meetinghouse. In addition to being hot, crowded, 
and foul smelling, the prisoners presumably had trouble 
communicating with each other as they spoke three differ-
ent languages – German, French, and English. 

The American guards outside the building also had 
to deal with exhaustion and heightened emotions, just 
like the men inside. Although exhilarated by their 
victory, many of the Americans knew that some of their 
friends and fellow soldiers had been killed in the 
fighting. Levi Green, a nineteen-year old militiaman from 
Lanesborough, Massachusetts recalled that, “He was 
employed after the battle in picking up the wounded and 
dying.” Another guard was sixteen-year old Benjamin 
Pierce, a private in Captain Kimball Carleton’s New 
Hampshire company. Pierce’s experiences obviously 
affected him profoundly. Many years later a friend wrote, 
“he saw and engaged in the latter part of the affair 
[battle] and assisted to take care of the wounded and to 
bury the dead. He told me how they buried them; the 
different manner of the appearances of their wounds.”10 
Furthermore, the guards had the heavy responsibility of 
maintaining security over a large number of prisoners. 
They also had to consider that Burgoyne might send 
troops to rescue them. If the prisoners successfully 
escaped or if British troops reappeared, all that Stark’s 
men had achieved might be quickly undone. 

Another factor that influenced the Americans’ 
thoughts was their intense distrust of the German troops, 
whom they considered ruthless mercenaries. The thought 
of facing the “Hessians” had played on American minds 
ever since Fall 1775 when news arrived that Britain was 
recruiting them. By the following spring, the colonists 
knew that thousands of auxiliary soldiers from several 
German principalities were sailing toward America.11

 

Indeed, one of the twenty-seven indictments leveled at 
King George III in the Declaration of Independence was 
that, “He is, at this time, transporting large armies of 
foreign mercenaries to complete the works of death, 
desolation, and tyranny....”12 These fears were realized 
when 8,000 German troops arrived at Staten Island with 
General William Howe’s army in August 1776. These 
soldiers then played a pivotal role in the ensuing New 
York campaign and the march across New Jersey, where 
they quickly gained a reputation for ferocity, brutality, 
and plundering.13

 

Reports of German depredations filled American 
newspapers for months to come, which further blackened 
their reputation. The October 30, 1776, edition of The Mas-
sachusetts Spy wrote “The Hessians plundered all indis-
criminately, Tories as well as Whigs; if they see any thing 
they want, they seize it, and say, ‘Rebel, good for Hesse-
man.’ A Tory complained to General Howe that he was 
plundered by the Hessians; the General said he could not 
help it, it was their way of making war.” Three months 
later, The Freeman’s Journal reported, “The Country from 
Princeton to the Delaware . . . has been thought the happi-
est Retreat of Peace and Safety, instead of which it is now 
the Scene of Blood shed and Rapine, Humanity force a 
Sigh for the suffering Women and Children. The Hessians 
are Robbers, and the English Troops Brutes.” Equally 
ominously, other reports noted the Germans’ propensity 
for not granting quarter to their foes. The Norwich Packet 
published a number of stories that developed this theme. 
On January 27, 1777 it reported that upon arriving in 
Halifax, Nova Scotia the Germans, “took an oath to spare 
neither man, woman, nor child.” Two months later the 
newspaper carried an account of “Hessians” slaughtering 
2,000 American prisoners on Long Island and then seem-
ingly confirmed the report in its May 12th edition. “Extract 
of a letter from an Officer in General Frazer’s battalion, 
Dated Sept. 3, 1776” boasted of the German and Highland 
troops’ performance, as they “gave no quarters; and it was 
a fine sight, to see with what alacrity, they dispatched the 
rebels with their bayonets, after we had surrounded them, 
so that they could not resist.”14

 

Admittedly many of these reports amounted to little 
more than exaggerated propaganda designed to strengthen 
the American resolve to fight. They also applied to the 
German troops serving with Howe, not necessarily those 
who had arrived in Canada with Burgoyne. Still, none this 
particularly mattered and did nothing to diminish the 
stories’ effect. American civilians greatly feared the 
German troops and frequently fled when they approached. 
While marching south on the upper Hudson earlier in the 
summer, Surgeon Wasmus reported passing abandoned 
houses and fields of ripe grain. “Their [the civilians] 
enmity against the King of England and the fear of the 
Germans had driven them away.” One can question the 
reliability of Wasmus’s observations because he could not 
definitely know why the civilians had fled, but other 
evidence suggests that he was correct. As Burgoyne’s army 
marched south, hundred or thousands of men, women, 
and children, whether they were Whig, Loyalists, or 
neutral, packed up their most valuable possessions and 
fled to safer areas. Burgoyne’s Indians and Loyalists 
prompted some of this, but so did the Germans 
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and their fearsome reputation. Sarah Rudd, the widow of 
a Bennington militia officer, later wrote, “I can never 
forget, while any thing of memory lives, my flight on 
horse-back, and in feeble health, with my babe and two 
other small children and my eldest daughter running on 
foot by the side of me from Bennington to Williamstown 
under circumstances of great alarm and fear from Hes-
sians, tory-enemies, and Indians.”15

 

The incident at the Bennington Meetinghouse 
occurred against this background. Sometime after dark 
on August 17, the prisoners crammed inside the building 
heard the sound of breaking wood. Wasmus later specu-
lated that one of the boards holding the Canadians broke. 
Many of the other prisoners, however, thought that the 
overcrowded galleries were collapsing. Wasmus’s expla-
nation seems more reasonable because the building did 
not sustain any major damage and remained in use until 
1806.16 Still, the fear that the meetinghouse was caving in 
quickly spread, and the confined men panicked. Shouting 
in terror, they surged towards the doors, trying to escape. 
Some of them actually made it outside, while hundreds of 
others pressed on them from behind. 

This “breakout” caught the American guards by 
surprise. Suddenly they heard shouts and cries from the 
meetinghouse, and then prisoners began to burst through 
the doors into the darkness. The fact that the sentries 
could not understand German and French exacerbated 
the situation.17 Many years later in their pension deposi-
tions, two American soldiers stated that the prisoners 
were indeed trying to escape while another remembered 
that a “disturbance” had occurred among them. Only one 
soldier mentioned the panic caused by the breaking 
boards, and another merely stated that some of the pris-
oners made it outside.18

 

Regardless of why the Germans had pushed their 
way out of the meetinghouse, the guards responded with 
deadly force. Pompey Woodward, a fifteen-year old Black 
youth serving with the Massachusetts militia, recalled, 
“they were fired upon by the sentries, while [still] in the 
meeting house.” This volley into the building itself 
slowed the captives’ momentum. Meanwhile, other 
American soldiers confronted those who had made it 
outside. Rushing forward with bayonets, the guards 
drove the prisoners back into the building, pushing and 
clubbing them as they went. After a short noisy scuffle in 
the darkness, the sentries restored order and secured the 
area, but it came at a cost. Two Germans lay dead and 
five others were injured. In the confusion, however, five 
other prisoners reportedly escaped. In light of this 
breakout, the Americans searched all the prisoners in the 
church and confiscated any knives that they found, even 
butter knives. They then increased the number of guards 
around the meetinghouse.19

 

Although he was not present when the incident at the 
meetinghouse occurred, Wasmus heard the tumult and 
inadvertently became involved in it. Earlier that evening 
an American physician invited Wasmus and another 
captured surgeon named Sandhagen to dine at the house 
of a local militia captain, probably Elijah Dewey, who 
lived just down the road from the Catamount Tavern. 
When the uproar occurred at the meetinghouse, all the 
Americans rushed out, leaving Wasmus and Sandhagen 
alone. Fearing for their safety (or perhaps also trying to  

escape), the two German surgeons decided to return to 
the tavern. As soon as they left the Dewey residence, 
however, they ran into Reverend Thomas Allen and a 
squad of militia hurrying to the church. Allen, a resident 
of Pittsfield, Massachusetts and an ardent Whig, reput-
edly had told Stark several days earlier that he wanted to 
fight or would never turn out for an alarm again. Allen 
received his wish by participating in the Battle of Ben-
nington and later wrote an account of his experiences that 
appeared in the Connecticut Courant. He was now about 
to get another chance to fight. Seeing the two Germans in 
the road, “the barbaric pastor” furiously rushed towards 
them and began to flog Sandhagen with the flat of his 
sword, striking him forty to fifty times. Meanwhile, 
Allen’s men cocked their muskets and prepared to fire. At 
that moment an American major who had spoken with 
Wasmus the previous night fortuitously passed by. 
Seeing the commotion and recognizing the surgeon, he 
grabbed Wasmus from behind and separated Allen from 
the hapless Sandhagen. He then explained that the two 
Germans were physicians and took control of them, 
probably saving their lives. The major then led Wasmus 
and Sandhagen to the meetinghouse, where they treated 
the newly wounded German soldiers. Wasmus later 
recalled, “If the major had not recognized me in the dark, 
we would have been out of luck. I have never seen a man 
so enraged as this noble pastor.” Later that night, the 
American doctor with whom Wasmus was having dinner 
visited him at the church and brought him food. 20 This 
innocuous note ended the incident at the meetinghouse, 
which had been partly caused by the colonists’ mistrust 
of the German soldiers and their inability to understand 
them. 

Over the next several weeks, the Americans trans-
ferred the prisoners from Bennington. Many of the Loy-
alists were sent to their states for punishment, while the 
Germans marched for Boston. Some militia units returned 
home, but Stark and much of his command went on to 
fight at Saratoga. Slowly, life returned to some degree of 
normalcy in the town, following the tumultuous days of 
the battle and its aftermath. Today, a large monument in 
the cemetery of the First Congregational Church of Old 
Bennington marks the burial site of twenty-nine soldiers 
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Name of Sixteen German Soldiers on the Gravestone 
(Author’s Collection) 

who died in the local hospital from their wounds. This 
included sixteen Germans.21 While none of these men 
passed away on August 17, one cannot help but wonder if 
two of them were victims of a supposed prison break at the 
meetinghouse. 
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